
43 USC §1621. Miscellaneous provisions 

 (f) Land exchanges 

The Secretary, the Secretary of Defense, the Secretary of Agriculture, and the State of 
Alaska are authorized to exchange lands or interests therein, including Native selection rights, 
with the corporations organized by Native groups, Village Corporations, Regional Corporations, 
and the corporations organized by Natives residing in Juneau, Sitka, Kodiak, and Kenai, all as 
defined in this chapter, and other municipalities and corporations or individuals, the State (acting 
free of the restrictions of section 6(i) of the Alaska Statehood Act), or any Federal agency for the 
purpose of effecting land consolidations or to facilitate the management or development of the 
land, or for other public purposes. Exchanges shall be on the basis of equal value, and either 
party to the exchange may pay or accept cash in order to equalize the value of the property 
exchanged: Provided, That when the parties agree to an exchange and the appropriate 
Secretary determines it is in the public interest, such exchanges may be made for other than 
equal value. 

 (j) Interim conveyances and underselections 

(1) Where lands to be conveyed to a Native, Native Corporation, or Native group pursuant to 
this chapter as amended and supplemented have not been surveyed, the same may be 
conveyed by the issuance of an "interim conveyance" to the party entitled to the lands. Subject 
to valid existing rights and such conditions and reservations authorized by law as are imposed, 
the force and effect of such an interim conveyance shall be to convey to and vest in the 
recipient exactly the same right, title, and interest in and to the lands as the recipient would have 
received had he been issued a patent by the United States. Upon survey of lands covered by an 
interim conveyance a patent thereto shall be issued to the recipient. The boundaries of the 
lands as defined and conveyed by the interim conveyance shall not be altered but may then be 
redescribed, if need be, in reference to the plat of survey. The Secretary shall make appropriate 
adjustments to insure that the recipient receives his full entitlement. Where the term "patent," or 
a derivative thereof, is used in this chapter unless the context precludes such construction, it 
shall be deemed to include "interim conveyance," and the conveyances of land to Natives and 
Native Corporations provided for this chapter shall be as fully effectuated by the issuance of 
interim conveyances as by the issuance of patents. 

(2) Where lands selected and conveyed, or to be conveyed to a Village Corporation are 
insufficient to fulfill the Corporation's entitlement under section 1611(b), 1613(a), 1615(b), or 
1615(d) of this title, the Secretary is authorized to withdraw twice the amount of unfulfilled 
entitlement and provide the Village Corporation ninety days from receipt of notice from the 
Secretary to select from the lands withdrawn the land it desires to fulfill its entitlement. In making 
the withdrawal, the Secretary shall first withdraw public lands that were formerly withdrawn for 
selection by the concerned Village Corporation by or pursuant to section 1610(a)(1), 1610(a)(3), 
1615(a), or 1615(d) of this title. Should such lands no longer be available, the Secretary may 
withdraw public lands that are vacant, unreserved, and unappropriated, except that the 
Secretary may withdraw public lands which had been previously withdrawn pursuant to section 
1616(d) of this title. Any subsequent selection by the Village Corporation shall be in the manner 
provided in this chapter for such original selections. 

(3) In lieu of withdrawal under paragraph (2), land may be segregated from all other forms of 
appropriation for the purposes described in that paragraph if— 

(A) the Secretary and the Village Corporation enter into an agreement identifying the land 
for selection; and 

(B) the Village Corporation files an application for selection of the land. 
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